REQUEST

Many thanks for your response to my earlier FOI
(https://www.whatdotheyknow.com/request/homophobic_hate_crimes_reported_45?nocache
=incoming-1022022#incoming-1022022)asking for numbers on homophobic hate crimes
reported in Newham. | would like some further break down of those numbers if possible and
would like to follow up that request with three more questions.

1. Could you provide me with the arrest, charge and conviction rates for the homophobic hate
crimes reported in Newham from 2012-2017 2. Could you also let me know how many of the
reported homophobic hate crimes were being made by Newham residents and those who live
outside Newham. if possible could you please also provide a break up of the age and ethnicity
of those reporting these crimes.

3. Could you also provide me with homophobic hate crimes reported in the same period (2012-
2017) in the neighbouring boroughs of Hackney, Tower Hamlets and Redbridge.

Yours faithfully,

RESPONSE

Thank you for your further Freedom of Information request of 14 August to the Mayor’s Office
for Policing And Crime (MOPAC). | confirm that your request has been handled under the
Freedom of Information Act 2000 and that MOPAC does hold some information relating to your
request, as follows:

1. Could you provide me with the arrest, charge and conviction rates for the homophobic
hate crimes reported in Newham from 2012-2017

| confirm that MOPAC does not hold information relating to this request. The Metropolitan
Police Service (MPS) may be able to assist you. You can send your FOI request directly to them,
using this link: http://www.met.police.uk/foi/

2. Could you also let me know how many of the reported homophobic hate crimes were
being made by Newham residents and those who live outside Newham. if possible
could you please also provide a break up of the age and ethnicity of those reporting
these crimes.

| confirm that MOPAC does not hold information relating to this request. The Metropolitan
Police Service (MPS) may be able to assist you. You can send your FOI request directly to them,
using this link: http://www.met.police.uk/foi/

3. Could you also provide me with homophobic hate crimes reported in the same period
(2012-2017) in the neighbouring boroughs of Hackney, Tower Hamlets and
Redbridge.

Please see table below:

Calendar Tower ‘

4. Data Year Hackney Redbridge Hamlets
Homophobic Hate Crime Incidents 2012 65 19 77
2013 47 26 74

2014 75 29 66

2015 95 23 87

2016 113 33 99

2017 65 20 62
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Homophobic Hate Crime Offences 2012 66 16 67
2013 57 23 74
2014 80 26 67
2015 103 20 92
2016 113 28 113
2017 74 24 70

If you are unhappy with the response to your Freedom of Information request, please see the
MOPAC website on what the next steps are at:
https://www.london.gov.uk/what-we-do/mayors-office-policing-and-crime-mopac/governance-and-
decision-making/freedom-information
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