REQUEST
| would like to receive the following information:

1) a copy of the terms of references for the “stop & search monitoring groups” operating in each
borough.

2) a copy of the terms of references for the “stop & search monitoring network” that brings together the
chair people of each S&S monitoring group.

3) a copy of the 2019 (or 2018 if 2019 not yet available) Stop & Search summary for the borough of
Islington submitted by Sheri Lawal to MOPAC or the S&S Monitoring Network. | believe each borough
has to provide regular updates in form of reports?

3) a copy of the 2019/2018 impact report for S&S in Islington

4) a copy of the 2019 (or 2018 if 2019 not yet available) on Stop & Search summary report for London
if this exist

RESPONSE

Thank you for your Freedom of Information request of 10 February to the Mayor’s Office for Policing
And Crime (MOPAC). | apologise for the delay in replying to you. | confirm that your request has
been handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000; please see responses below:

1. a copy of the terms of references for the “stop & search monitoring groups”
operating in each borough.

MOPAC has provided a model terms of reference for all Community Monitoring Groups (CMGs),
which has been attached for your reference. However, as independent bodies, CMGs are
currently at liberty to amend the terms of reference to suit local circumstances. This is under
review and a revised Terms of Reference will be posted on our website when it has been agreed
through the Community Monitoring Network.

2. a copy of the terms of references for the “stop & search monitoring network”
that brings together the chair people of each S&S monitoring group.

This information is already published,
here: https://www.london.gov.uk/sites/default/files/mopac stop and search community monitori
ng network terms of reference.pdf

3. a copy of the 2019 (or 2018 if 2019 not yet available) Stop & Search summary for the
borough of Islington submitted by Sheri Lawal to MOPAC or the S&S Monitoring Network. |
believe each borough has to provide regular updates in form of reports?

MOPAC does not hold any information relating to this request. MOPAC do not receive
summaries or reports from Community Monitoring Groups. Issues are discussed at Community
Monitoring Network meetings which take place quarterly. The notes from the meetings are
posted on the MOPAC website and can be found through the following link.

https://www.london.gov.uk/what-we-do/mayors-office-policing-and-crime-mopac/community-
safety/stop-and-search-community-monitoring-network#acc-i-57398

4. a copy of the 2019/2018 impact report for S&S in Islington
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MOPAC does not hold any information relating to this request. MOPAC does not receive or
write impact reports for stop and search in Islington.

5. a copy of the 2019 (or 2018 if 2019 not yet available) on Stop & Search
summary report for London if this exist

MOPAC produce and publish a quarterly performance monitoring pack with updated stop
and search information and data. The report can be found by following the below link. Stop
and search is referenced on page 36, here:
https://www.london.gov.uk/sites/default/files/mopac g3 report 260220.pdf

In addition, a range of stop and search data is published by the MPS
here: https://www.met.police.uk/sd/stats-and-data/met/stop-and-search-dashboard/

If you are unhappy with the response to your Freedom of Information request, please see the
MOPAC website on what the next steps are at: https://www.london.gov.uk/what-we-do/mayors-
office-policing-and-crime-mopac/governance-and-decision-making/freedom-information
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