
(Via email) 

Our Ref: MGLA260825-2960 

11 December 2025 

Thank you for your further correspondence which the Greater London Authority (GLA) received 
on 22 August 2025.  

You have expressed dissatisfaction with the way the GLA has responded to a request for 
information that you have made. I am now responding to you under the GLA’s internal review 
procedure in relation to our response to case. 

Background 

On 20 June 2025, you submitted the following requests for information (GLA ref MGLA200625-
8390): 

I am requesting information under the Freedom of Information Act regarding the Crystal 
Palace National Sports Centre (CPNSC) redevelopment. 

As part of the GLA's 2018 On Your Marks engagement programme, users of the CPNSC were 
asked to complete feedback questionnaires—both online and via paper forms submitted into 
large drop boxes at the centre’s reception. 

Hawkins\Brown, the campaign organiser, stated that all responses were “packaged” for use 
in the next stages of the project. However, the Feasibility Study – Final Report, which used 
relied on this 'packaged data' appears to reference only online responses, despite many 
sports groups relying heavily on the paper feedback forms. NSC staff members reported 
these drop boxes were filled and replaced multiple times, indicating a high volume of 
responses—likely in the thousands. 

Accordingly, I am requesting the following information specifically from the paper feedback 
forms (excluding the online responses): 

• A proportional breakdown of sporting activities most frequently requested for
inclusion or improvement on the paper forms. 

• The total number of requests per sporting activity for inclusion or improvement,
based solely on the paper form responses. 



The GLA responded to you on 16 July 2025 and informed you that: 

The GLA does not hold the raw data from the 2018 engagement and associated 
questionnaires. The results from the engagement, including questionnaires, were 
compiled and analysed by engagement consultants Pidgeon Perfect, who produced a 
report which was shared with you as part of a previous information request in 2024: FOI 
- Crystal Palace National Sports Centre [Jun 2024] | London City Hall

Your complaint 

With regards to our response, you have submitted the following complaint(s): 

I am requesting an internal review of your response to my FOI request (MGLA200625-
8390). 

Your response stated that the GLA does not hold the raw data from the 2018 
engagement and associated questionnaires, as these were compiled and analysed by your 
engagement consultants, Pigeon Perfect. 

However, under s.3(2)(b) FOIA, information is deemed held by a public authority if it is 
held on its behalf by a contractor. The ICO’s outsourcing guidance confirms this 
principle. By claiming not to hold this data, the GLA is failing in its statutory 
transparency obligations and is in breach of its legal duty. 

Accordingly, I again request disclosure of: 

1. The total number of paper consultation forms submitted in the Crystal Palace
National Sports Centre consultation. 

2. A breakdown of the topics, sports or facilities most commonly raised in those
forms. 

3. Any correspondence between the GLA and Pigeon Perfect (the contractor)
regarding the treatment of these paper forms — specifically discussions about 
whether they would be collated, analysed, or incorporated into the feasibility 
study. 

I note that the published Feasibility Study report analyses online survey responses, 
workshops, and community conference “short response forms,” but nowhere mentions, 
incorporates, or analyses the responses gathered via the widely distributed “On Your 
Marks!” paper consultation feedback forms (which invited ratings, comments, age group 
and postcode, and were collected at the NSC foyer in a dedicated postbox over several 
months). 

Failure to include these paper responses means: 

• Voices that were explicitly invited have been silenced.
• Vulnerable communities without reliable internet access were excluded.
• Grassroots clubs and companies who relied on paper forms to represent their

members were frozen out. 

https://www.london.gov.uk/who-we-are/governance-and-spending/sharing-our-information/foi-disclosure-log/foi-crystal-palace-national-sports-centre-jun-2024
https://www.london.gov.uk/who-we-are/governance-and-spending/sharing-our-information/foi-disclosure-log/foi-crystal-palace-national-sports-centre-jun-2024


• The consultation results do not fairly reflect actual demand for sports: if the
majority of responses for certain activities were on paper but excluded, the 
published analysis is distorted and unrepresentative. 

This omission breaches Gunning Principle 4 (responses must be conscientiously taken 
into account) and constitutes procedural unfairness, as confirmed by the Supreme Court 
in R (Moseley) v Haringey [2014] UKSC 56. 

The exclusion of paper responses renders the consultation unlawful and invalid, requiring 
that it be conducted again to meet lawful standards. I therefore request that the internal 
review considers the above points and requires disclosure in line with FOIA obligations.

Internal review 

The Freedom of Information Act and Environmental Information Regulations give you rights to 
access official information. Internal reviews are handled by the Information Governance team. 
We are responsible for reviewing any decision and the material (if held). 

This internal review is conducted by someone who was not involved in the handling of the 
original request. I will now respond to each point of your request in turn: 

• Review of information held by the GLA

For the purpose of this internal review, I can confirm that, as stated in our original 
correspondence, the GLA did not hold the information requested. I can also confirm that, as 
stated in Companies House records, Pidgin Perfect Ltd was dissolved on 12th October 2021.  

I have consulted with Hawkins Brown Architects LLP as the lead consultant and with whom it is 
understood Pidgin Perfect acted as a sub-contractor, to determine whether the information 
requested has been retained. The distinction will not always be clear-cut and in this instance the 
contract ended some time ago.  

Although the contract itself does not always provide a definite answer as to whether a third 
party holds information on our behalf, I have considered all the facts relevant to the request to 
establish if there is an appropriate connection between the information and our functions as a 
public authority. I can confirm however that this information was retained and is now attached. 

Please note that names are identifiable personal information is exempt from disclosure under 
s.40 (Personal information) of the Freedom of Information Act. This information could
potentially identify specific members of the public and as such constitutes as personal data 
which is defined by Article 4(1) of the General Data Protection Regulation (GDPR) to mean any 
information relating to an identified or identifiable living individual. It is considered that 
disclosure of this information would contravene the first data protection principle under Article 
5(1) of GDPR which states that Personal data must be processed lawfully, fairly and in a 
transparent manner in relation to the data subject. 

I would also like to note that this consultation material relates to work undertaken several years 
ago. Crystal Palace National Sports Centre engagement is an ongoing process including recent 
public consultation activity in the past two months: Latest news and project updates from the 
Morgan Sindall Construction CPNSC project | Morgan Sindall Construction 

https://www.morgansindallconstruction.com/our-projects/live-projects/cpnsc/cpnscnews/
https://www.morgansindallconstruction.com/our-projects/live-projects/cpnsc/cpnscnews/


• Breakdown of the topics, sports or facilities most raised in those forms.

The GLA does not hold a copy of the information recorded in this way, however the raw data is 
provided, and you are free to draw on this information to reach your own conclusions.  

• Correspondence with Pidgin Perfect

We have responded to a subsequent request from you for this information and are now dealing 
with a refined request which we are currently processing, and we will respond to you on this 
request in due course: 

Thank you for your response and for confirming the initial search results. To bring the 
request within the appropriate cost limit, I would like to revise and narrow the scope as 
follows. 

- Custodians
Please limit the search to the mailboxes of: 
[named GLA staff] 

- External correspondence
Please include only emails exchanged with any address ending in @pidginperfect.com 

- Keywords
Please search only for emails containing any of the following terms: 
"postcards" 
"feedback forms" 
"paper forms" 

- Date range
1 August 2018 to 1 May 2019, covering the active consultation period, the handling of 
paper responses and finalisation of the feasibility study. 

This revision is tightly focused on communications concerning the treatment of the 
paper consultation responses gathered during the On Your Marks engagement and 
should considerably reduce the volume of material that must be reviewed. 

Outcome 

In reviewing your complaint, the GLA has reviewed its previous response, and it is correct that 
the GLA did not hold the information requested.  

The GLA has now explored whether the lead consultant providing the services – Hawkins Brown 
– held the information. Further information has been obtained from them, that is now shared 
with you, in scope of your request for information.  

Bear in mind that FOIA is about recorded information held by the Public Authority, some 
information is being provided to you in the raw format it was recorded, not necessarily recorded 
in the way you have requested it. The Act is clear that the Authority doesn’t need to create new 
information to comply with a request. 



I can therefore confirm that we have provided you with the information held by both the GLA as 
well as the service provider in response to your request. 

I trust I have addressed your concerns. However, if you remain dissatisfied you may take your 
complaint to the Information Commissioner at the following address: 

Information Commissioner’s Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
SK9 5AF 
http://www.ico.org.uk/complaints 

Yours sincerely 

Sylvia Edohasim 
Information Governance Manager 





































































































































































































Help Crystal Palace National Sports 
Centre become a place fit for the future 

In 2019, important choices will be made to help the 
Centre reach a new personal best. What do you 
think are the three main priorities for the future? 

2 8� f tfvVh1ApAli (W\ • 

{!p1u C,/4{1A(}2v-?1 p /)Ah heed fw: 7kP-
J 

'ostcode Collecting postcode and age group information helps us better 
understand how well we have reached the community. All responses 
are anonymised and will be used as part of consultation reporting, 
within public presentations, and at On Your Marks! events . 

. ge Group 

lnder 18 19 - 30 8 45 - 60 61+ 

isit www.on-your-marks.co.uk to fill out our online questionnaire 
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